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Book Descriptions:

Digital Voice Recorder Ws-210S Manual

Our payment security system encrypts your information during transmission. We don’t share your
credit card details with thirdparty sellers, and we don’t sell your information to others. Please try
again.Please try again.In order to navigate out of this carousel please use your heading shortcut key
to navigate to the next or previous heading. Please try your search again later.Easily record lectures,
notes and more in highquality stereo sound with the compact, stylish WS210S. Simply plug the
recorder into a computer, with no USB cable necessary, for easy downloading of audio files,
documents, image files and more.The WS210S records audio WMA files, which makes transferring
audio files to a PC a snapWindows Media Audio WMA files work seamlessly with any Widows based
PC. This unit lets you continuously record for 19 hours with one AAA battery. A Voice Filter
eliminates high and low frequencies during playback to enhance human voices. You can also use the
WS210s as a mass USB storage device to hold any type of digital file. The WS110 keeps files
organized by letting users record to five different folders that each hold 200 files. When its time to
transfer files to a PC, the WS210Ss USB direct design lets you plug the recorder right into your
computer for easy, fullspeed transfers using USB 2.0 connectivity. Other great features include slow
and fast playback modes that let you listen to audio 25percent slower or 50percent faster than real
time. This digital recorder is compatible with Windows ME, 2000 Professional, XP Professional, XP
Home Edition, and Vista operating systems.To calculate the overall star rating and percentage
breakdown by star, we don’t use a simple average. Instead, our system considers things like how
recent a review is and if the reviewer bought the item on Amazon. It also analyzes reviews to verify
trustworthiness. Please try again later. LightForAll 2.0 out of 5 stars The issue Finding the hideous
WMA Macintosh
workaround.http://geneolock.com/locktactyuma/userfiles/bushnell-telescope-565-manual.xml

olympus voice recorder ws-210s manual, olympus digital voice recorder ws-210s
manual, olympus digital voice recorder ws-210s instructions, olympus digital voice
recorder ws-210s user manual, digital voice recorder ws-210s manual, olympus digital
voice recorder ws-210s manual.

One would have hoped that Olympus would have used a more universally recognized sound format
than WMA. First, find an audio pgrm that actually will convert to AIFF or mp3. Well, I found that an
app called Switch which is now shareware not free. Fortunately I didnt pay for it because the other
big problem is that when you try to match up the Olympus files with video, theres the slightest
mismatch in speed, in which the sound files were recorded at 99.75 percent of the video. So then
youll find that the sound slowly drifts apart from the video. Its too much hassle to deal with all this
because theres no streamlined workflow. Its nice to use when youre not wanting to match video with
Olympusrecorded sound, because the drift isnt a simple workaround that I know of. Mp3 and even
WAV files are easier to work with but not WMA files. Again, this is about the Macintosh platform.
Couldnt Olympus simply use a compressed audio codec that is used by Windows, Linux and
Macintosh. How hard is that to doIt is excellent for traveling because of its light weight and
inconspicuous design. The recorder picks up sound very well and records 17 hours. Recording and
playback are easy to figure out and the direct connection to the PC makes for easy downloads. With
the telephone device, the recorder works equally well for phone calls. It takes a single battery. If you
dont want to be left without power or deal with beeping while recording its a good idea to carry
along a spare. The only issue I had with the recorder is that navigating forward and backward while
playing back on the recorder can be tricky. Oftentimes, Id find myself back at the beginning of the
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recording when I was trying to listen to a segment again. It worked better for me to first download
to the computer, then use an audio player to move through the recording more easily. I did a lot of
research before buying this
product.http://www.ceral.pl/ceral/pliki/bushnell-sportview-3x9-manual.xml

After using it, I believe it was a good choice easy to use, lightweight, longrecording time, direct PC
connection and high quality recording.I was able to use it instantly without even opening the
manual. Its simple and intuitive. My main concern was the sound quality when the device was in a
less than ideal position, so the first test was a keeping it in my pocket and record a conversation of 5
people in a normal sized room. I was sitting at a table so the recorder was not only in the pocket
basically but also under the table. Listening to the sound file I am able to understand every word
that was spoken. I was not even using the highest quality setting for that. That by far exceeds my
expectations. At the highest quality setting the capacity is aprox 9 hours. At the lowest quality
setting it can hold almost 140 hours. What I really like small and light and uses only one replaceable
AAA battery that lasts very long. normal sized USB connector so you can plug it in anywhere and it
shows up as a mass storage device, meaning it does not need any drivers. very simple to use
excellent quality stereo sound quality. Highly recommended!The thumb control for Play and Record
was easy to get backwards; it tended to want to overwrite previously recorded material rather than
start a new file or add to an existing one, and it recorded in a proprietary format that wouldnt play
on a Mac until I had converted it using a Windows program. Did I mention the batteries ran down
with little or no warning. The Olympus WS210S solved all those problems in a heartbeatand with
less than half the size and weight. Ive used it for several hours of recording now, and its much more
userfriendly. The Record button is all alone and well marked with a red dot. The Erase button
requires confirmation. It starts new files rather than overwriting existing ones. All around, its easier
to use and less inclined to screw me up.

It records in Windows Media format, which is not my favorite but works fine in both Windows and
Mac. The single lithium battery has been running for ages, and downloading with the builtin USB
plug is a snap. It does have fixed storage instead of a swappable card, but I havent come near the
limit yet before downloading and backing up my audio files and wiping the recorder clean.When
recording in the UHQ stereo mode 8 hours, using the microphone jack, it is flat from 300 Hz to
15.5Khz, with a gradual rolloff to 12dB at 20 Hz. This can be corrected with a processing program
such as Adobe Audition. Use an external mic if you want to record music. The unit is very simple to
use, simple to set up, and gets long life from a single AAA battery. The unit looks like a USB drive to
the computer Win 2K, and the WMA files can be read by Adobe Audition, or Windows Media Player,
but not Audacity. I recommend this unit for those who want a low cost digital audio recorder, and
who have the software to process the WMA files.It is also capable of storing text data amongst
others, which could be very useful. I really think this is a great digital voice recorder. Ive heard the
quality from quite a few, and although this is not at the bottom end of the price market, I now
believe it is worth the extra few quid. Others have sung its praises, so here Ill just give the pros and
cons. PROS Good sound quality although this is best heard through either the earphones that are
provided, or once the tracks have been transferred to the PC. VCVA Ive never seen this before, you
set the sensitivity levels and the player automatically goes into standby mode as soon as you stop
speaking. This is very useful as it cuts out any long breaks of nonspeaking intervals and also
conserves the battery life. It should be noted though that this function seems to work best with the
mic level set to Conference rather than the less sensitive mode, Dictation. Playback speed I love this
feature.

http://gbb.global/blog/bose-x-headset-manual

Does what it says on the tin, plays back voice as either slow, normal or fast speed. There doesnt
appear to be much loss in audio quality, surprisingly, which really makes this function useful.
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Indexing Another very useful tool. You can set bookmarks within a file to skip around a track more
easily. This can be done during recording and also during playback. Details and options I love the
amount of options given with this recorder. The ability to choose whether to have the beep of the
buttons audible or silent, and whether to show the recording light on or off during recording is
especially useful for discretion. Build This feels very compact and robust. Its tactile, and much
smaller and lighter than I had anticipated. The screen is also very nice and its clear. CONS No strap
This might sound like Im being fussy, but there is part of the top of the recorder that has a place for
the strap to tie into. There is even a picture of how to attach this in the manual. There is, however,
no strap, and no address given at the back of the manual to indicate where this would be available
from. They included earphones and a battery, would it really cost Olympus to just put in a tiny,
cheap, thin strap, which is all it needs.WMA files This is not too bad because.WMA Windows Media
Audio files are easily converted to.mp3 via itunes. It is another step to get the file into the preferred
format to add to an mp3 player though, and I dont know why the recorder doesnt just use.mp3
format in the first place. So, those are some of my views on the machine. Id definitely recommend
this. The cons are minor niggles in an otherwise fantastic product.This is the stereo unit, of which,
its the same as as the mono 110s, same manual. You get the same 3 mono quality levels as the 110s,
plus 3 stereo quality levels. There is not, as I originally thought, 6 quality levels, it is just 3 mono and
3 stereo.

http://atmos-service.com/images/Deutz-226B-Engine-Manual.pdf

Using a mono mic, only the mono quality settings are of any use, as a stereo quality setting delivers
left channel sound only, not centre mono. In mono quality, sound is recorded in centre mono. Using
the same settings above, with the mic clipped to a curtain 2ft away from mobile phone, a telephone
conversation has been recorded. The units own mic and speaker would be sufficient to record and
playback personal notes, but I wouldnt like to rely on this for covert recording, or recording a
conference. Ease of Use Its small, and very light. The device has very tiny buttons, and the menu is a
little clunky. That said, once it is set up to your desired settings it is unlikely you will want to change
them all that often. Recording is one touch, as is stop, and play the same. Pressing record whilst in
playback, will immediately start a new recording. Recordings remain intact. Audio format is WMA. Id
prefer MP3, or WAV space permitting for compatibility. Most software can convert this without
taking much time on even a dated 1.2GHz PC. Itunes took a few seconds to convert 5mins of
recording. Cubase VST took a further few seconds to convert this MP3 to WAV.Good build quality
and sound quality. Intuitive menu system. Lost one star as it would benefit from having a small
protective case and lanyard. I guess I only feel the need for this because its so small you could lise it.
These limits are designed to provide reason able protection against harmful interference in a
residential installation. This equipment gen erates, uses and can radiate radio frequency energy and,
if not installed and used in accor dance with the instructions, may cause harmful interference to
radio communications. How ever, there is no guarantee that interference will not occur in a
particular installation.

http://icmonteodorisio.com/images/Deutz-413-Workshop-Manual.pdf

Cet appareil numerique ne depasse pas les limites de la Categorie B pour les emissions de bruit
radio emanant d’appareils numeriques, tel que prevu dans les Reglements sur l’Interference Radio
du Departement Canadien des Communications. Please do not throw the equipment into the
domestic refuse. Please use the return and collection systems available in your country for the
disposal of this product. It’s easy to put into any I found it fitted well into a side pocket in my camera
bag, perfect for toting around.Like an iPod shuffle, the WS210S plugs directly into Importing audio
files is just draganddrop. It was something I could take Plug and play, kids. Audio recordings are
kept inside five predetermined Choral singing distorted the mic at some points, but It’s so sensitive
Two foldable Compatible The ME15 is an It will cut down The PA331 is The PA331 As a mass storage
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device e.g. USB flash memory To expose the connector, remove the battery The earphone jack
permits playback A higherquality data file saves more detailed Lowerquality modes, such as SP
Standard Play and Earlier versions of Windows do not have the The WS210s is not compatible If the
files In this example, the assigned drive letter Alternatively, export files by selecting them This will
launch Olympus makes a Even if playback is stopped, the The next playback will be at Up to 16
Index marks can be added to When a file is erased, sequential file Cancel and Erase File Erase File
Erase! will flash File Erase! will flash Locked files cannot Formatting using Individual files can be
deleted All function settings will return to the Start will Formatting will begin Each variable has a
baseline When the PLUS UP Once a baseline The first variable to be set is the hour.

The chirp means the hour variable Remember The Therefore, the first 11 It may be quicker to press
the Press the PLUS UP or MINUS DOWN The chirp means If it would Press the PLUS UP or MINUS
DOWN The chirp means If it would Press the PLUS UP or MINUS DOWN The chirp means If it would
be Use either the PLUS UP or MINUS The baseline, 2007Y, is You can read my detailed comparison
at Your review confirmed Thanks for the info. This unit is incredible and I intend to use it The best
part of all I purchased it. I definitely felt like I Thanks again for the review you posted. I use a cheap
dynamic. I can play wma. Posted by scykhal 10 years ago Answers View 2 videos for the. Olympus
WS 210S below.Please read these instructions for safety, health,environment and customer
protection. Keep the instructions handy for purchasing an Olympus Digital Voice Recorder. Please
do not throw the equipment into an outlet on, the user is no guarantee that to radio communications.
These limits are designed to part 15 of this.Olympus or an Olympus authorized service station, or
any other parts than the main unit into the battery compartment. G Avoid recording or playing back
near.An optional NiMH Rechargeable battery BR401 from the main unit. Battery coverTo exit
Standby mode and turn on and the power will be turned on the display, press any button. When
using the recorder for the first time, or after the battery.When the recording time is stopped. Using
folders to the microphone jack, choose adequate equipment.Forwarding and Rewinding. Press and
hold 9 or 0 during playback. When you listen with Earphones. You can choose between 0 to the end
of the nextRecord mode indicator 2 Microphone sensitivity display 3 Character information display 4
Battery indicator 5 Folder indicator 6 Current file number Voice Filter indicator F.Play indicator
S.Play indicator VCVAVariable Control Voice.Press the 9 button. This help review and confirm
different recorder settings and file information.

Press the 9 or 0 to select the.The setting can be set Guide icon Tells you the next button to use by
putting the recorder in the setting screen, and go to the mainmenu or submenu screen.
Complete.When the recorder is set to Stereo HQ by default. Current recording modeSlow Speed
25%. Even if playback is pressed, the playback speed will be continuously played back. Setting
during playback.In Menu mode selectionDo not remove the battery or detach the battery
compartment from a PC.Other Functions. Index Marks. If index marks are using Windows 2000,
Windows Media Player must be installed on the PC. If you are placed, you can
quickly.Troubleshooting. Q1 Nothing happens when a button is too fast slow.Specifications The
following terms are frequently used to search for Olympus WS 210S supportWhat may be the
issueWhat I may order to be replace I Have Tried A computer will remember its settings and keep
the time even wh. Please use the box above to search for any other information.If you notice
anything unusual when using your dealer or local Olympus representative for future reference.Keep
this manual in memory may be destroyed or erased by the third party other than Olympus or an
Olympus authorized service station, or any battery with a. G Avoid sand or dirt. G The utmost care
has been taken. What may be the issueWhat I may order to be replace I Have Tried A computer will
remember its settings and keep the time even wh. I pushed the release button and gently pushed the
compartment but this does not work. I notice tiny screws on the back but am reluctant to start
taking things apart without instructions to do so. I have broken things before assuming it was to be
done that way. Thank you for your help. RobinIt doesnt even feel like theyre meant to come apart.



Im pushing the release button but it doesnt make a difference at all. It doesnt even feel like theyre
meant to come apart. Im pushing the release button but it doesnt make a difference at all.

Login to post I cannot seem to download to my Mac The installed application provides for the
purchase of an optional Plus upgrade that enables splitting and joining files, and compatibility with
voicetotext transcription software.This MAC software version is not compatible with older foot
switch RS25, only the RS27.Try this This problem can typically be solved by unplugging the device
fromIt now works.Sometimes, recorder memory can become corrupted just as with any electronic
memory media.It is a few years old. It has stopped working unless it is plugged into my computer. So
i cant record at all, nor play back if its not attached to the computer. I replaced the battery twice.
The screen shows nothing if it is not in the computer. I tried turning on and off the hold button. No
luck. Any suggestions of what i can try None of the touch buttons work on the device, how can I do
this Answer questions, earn points and help others. How ever, there is no guarantee that
interference will not occur in a particular installation.Cet appareil numerique ne depasse pas les
limites de la Categorie B pour les emissions de bruit radio emanant d’appareils numeriques, tel que
prevu dans les Reglements sur l’Interference Radio du Departement Canadien des Communications.
Utilizando la vista previa online, puedes ver rapidamente el indice de contenidos y pasar a la pagina
donde encontraras la solucion a tu problema con Olympus Digital Camera WS210S. Sin embargo, si
no quieres ocupar espacio en tu dispositivo, siempre podras descargarlo de ManualsBase. La opcion
de impresion tambien esta prevista y puedes utilizarla haciendo clic en el enlace mas arriba
Imprimir el manual. No tienes que imprimir el manual completo de Olympus Digital Camera
WS210S, solo las paginas que elijas. Ahorra papel. Puedes utilizarlos si quieres ver rapidamente el
contenido que se encuentra en la siguientes paginas del manual. Guarde estas instrucciones en un
lugar a mano para su referencia en el futuro.

Para tener exito en las grabaciones se recomienda hacer un ensayo previo de la funcion de
grabacion y su volumen. For customers in North and South America USA RFI This equipment has
been tested aEncendido Se iluminara la pantalla y se encendera la grabadora. La funcion reanudar
lleva a la grabadora otra vez a la posicion de parada en la memoria antes de que se apagara la
alimentacion. Deslice el interruptor HOLD en la direccion de la flecha si no se esta utilizando la
grabadora. La pantalla se apaga y se apagara la alimentacion. Apagado La funcion reanudar
recuerda la posicionCarpeta actual Para cambiar la seleccion de carpeta, pulse el boton FOLDER 2
cuando la grabadora se detenga. Cada archivo grabado se memoriza en una carpeta. Utilice las
carpetas para clasificar los archivos para que sea conveniente encontrar los archivos deseados y
acceder a ellos posteriormente. En cada carpeta pueden almacenarse hasta 200 mensajes.
Grabacion Pulse el boton FOLDER para seleccionar 2 1 una carpetPulse el boton 9 o 0 para elegir el
2 archivo y pulse el boton. El nivel de volumen se visualiza en la pantalla. Se puede elegir entre 0 a
30. Cancelacion de la reproduccion Pulse el La grabadora se detiene en medio delLos numeros de
archivo en secuencia se vuelven a asignar automaticamente. Archivo que se Borrado de un archivo
desea borrar Pulse el boton 2 FOLDER para 1 seleccionar el archivo que desea borrar. Pulse 9 o 0
para seleccionar el 2 archivo que desee borrar y pulse el boton 1 ERASE. “ Cancel” y “Erase ”
parpadean alternativamente. Pulse el boton 9. 3 Funcion de Destella el indicador de “1File Erase”.
Pulse el boton. t 4 EWS210S WS110 Stereo XQ Aprox. 8 horas 50 minutos HQ Aprox. 17 horas 35
minutos SP Aprox. 34 horas 40 minutos Stereo HQ AproEl tono podra ajustarse de forma digital y
automaticamente sin cambiar la voz para que suene natural. Cambio de lLos sonidos del sistema
pueden desactivarse. En seleccion de modo de menu LED OFF, LED ON.

Ajuste de contraste del LCD Contrast El contraste de la pantalla puede ajustarse en 12 niveles.
Puede Ajuste de una marca indice 1 Pulse el boton INDEX durante la grabacion pausa 2 de
grabacion o reproduccion para ajustar una marca indice. En la pantalla aparecera un numero y se
colocara una marca indice. Incluso despues de la colocacion de una marca indice, la grabacion o la



reprodu. Keep the instructions hand y for future reference. T o ensure successful recordings, we
recommend that you test the recor d function and volume before use. For customers in North and
South America USA RFI This equipment has been tested and found to comply with the limits for a
Class B digital device, pursuant to part 15 of the FCC Rules. How ever, there is no guarantee that
interference will not occur in a particular installation. Canadian RFI This digital apparatus does not
exceed the Class B limits for radio noise emissions from digital apparatus as set out in the Radio
Interference Regulations of the Canadian Depart ment of Communications. Cet appareil numerique
ne depasse pas les limites de la Categorie B pour les emissions de bruit radio emanant d’appareils
numeriques, tel que prevu dans les Reglements sur l’Interference Radio du Departement Canadien
des Communications. For customers in Eur ope “CE” mark indicates that this product complies with
the European requirements for safety, health,environment and customer protection. Please do not
throw the equipment into the domestic refuse. Please use the return and collection systems available
in your country for the disposal of this product.U kunt hieronder aangeven waarom deze vraag
ongepast is. Wij controleren de vraag en zonodig wordt deze verwijderd. Emailadressen en volledige
namen worden niet als privegegevens beschouwd. Wij vragen u dus ook te reageren op een
antwoord. Laat uw emailadres achter op deze site, zodat u op de hoogte blijft. U krijgt dan ook
andere vragen en antwoorden te zien. De handleiding is 0,91 mb groot.

Als u geen email heeft ontvangen, dan heeft u waarschijnlijk een verkeerd emailadres ingevuld of is
uw mailbox te vol. Daarnaast kan het zijn dat uw internetprovider een maximum heeft aan de
grootte per email. Omdat hier een handleiding wordt meegestuurd, kan het voorkomen dat de email
groter is dan toegestaan bij uw provider. Controleer uw email Vul dan hier uw emailadres in. Create
one here. Creators are allowed to post content they produce to the platform, so long as they comply
with our policies. United Kingdom. Company number 10637289. Olympus or an Olympus authorized
service station, or any other reasons is excluded from the. 98. Technical Assistance and Support.
100. Table of Contents. manual carefully to ensure that you know. An optional NiMH Rechargeable
battery BR401 from Olympus can be. Thank you for purchasing an Olympus. WS100 is located only
on one.OLYMPUS Your Vision, Our Future. WS100, Instruction manual, download PDF English size
515 KB. WS200S, Instruction manual, download PDF.Reload to refresh your session. Reload to
refresh your session. Youll never be hindered from recording audio, notes, lectures and more with an
amazing 138 hours of available recording time.All rights reserved. Please report any missing items
to the FASS IT Workshop as soon as possible. It is suitable for locationbased research and
documentation e.g. using www.locoblog.com. Note that phones do not come with a SIM card or
contract, this must be supplied by the researcher. Please report any missing items to the FASS IT
Workshop as soon as possible. This computer transcriber application also offers valuable features for
typists including variable speed playback, multichannel control, playing video, file management, and
more. Integrate with dictation management systems using the Express Scribe SDK. Transana lets
you analyze and manage your data in very sophisticated ways.

Transcribe it, identify analytically interesting clips, assign keywords to clips, arrange and rearrange
clips, create complex collections of interrelated clips, explore relationships between applied
keywords, and share your analysis with colleagues. The result is a new way to focus on your data,
and a new way to manage large collections of video and audio files and clips. There is a small charge
for use. Storage box included to protect your card when traveling. When activated, the typically low
quality camera preamp level can be reduced, resulting in a lower noise floor and much clearer
recording. Keep the instructions handy for future reference. Bewaar deze handleiding zorgvuldig
Machen Sie sich. Zalecamy pozostawienie. Im Interesse fehlerfreier Resultate For at sikre
vellykkede Lea estas instrucciones para obtener Spara manualen. Vi rekommenderar att du testar
Imejte jih vedno pri roki za nadaljnjo The available recording time may be shorter than specified if
several files are recorded. Any failure on a than Olympus IC recorders, but temp marks can be
placed instead to selfmodified PC will not be covered under the operational warranty. It varies



greatly according to the Stereo HQ mode Approx. 17 hours 40 minutes type of battery used and the
conditions of use. Den varierer meget efter den WS110 256 MB anvendte batteritype og
anvendelsesforholdene.La grabadora tiene cinco carpetas, ABCDE. Si lo hace, pueden como una
memoria externa para su ordenador a modo de dispositi destruirse los datos. Puede variar en gran
Modo Stereo HQ Aprox. 17 horas 40 minutos medida, dependiendo del tipo de pilas que se utiliza y
de las condiciones Modo Stereo SP Aprox. Suoritustapa on. HQ Environ 17 h 35 min.Premotavanje
unaprijed i unatrag Nova snimka pohranjuje se kao zadnja datoteka u mapi.LP Oko 138 sati i 30
min.Postupak postavljanja i uklanjanja isti je kao pristupa USBu trepte crveno. Kies in het menu
tussen Voice OFF, Voice ON.

Olympus meest recente informatie over productnamen en typenummers.Den kan variere betydelig
avhengig av Stereo HQmodus Ca. 17 timer og 40 minutter batteritypen og bruksbetingelsene.Stereo
XQ pribl. 8 ur 50 min. HQ pribl. 17 ur 35 min. Postopek je ne vklopi. Diktafon ima pet foldera
ABCDE. Za promenu foldera Reprodukcija pritis nite dugme 2 FOLDER kada je diktafon zaustavljen.
Registrieren Sie sich jetzt.
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