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By using our site, you agree to our cookie policy.Learn why people trust wikiHow Ibrahim Onerli is
the Partner and Manager of Revolution Driving School, a New York Citybased driving school with a
mission to make the world a better place by teaching safe driving. Ibrahim trains and manages a
team of over 8 driving instructors and specializes in defensive driving and stick shift driving.This
article received 171 testimonials and 94% of readers who voted found it helpful, earning it our
readerapproved status.To drive a manual, youll need to familiarize yourself with the clutch, become
comfortable with the gearstick, and practice starting, stopping, and shifting gears at various driving
speeds.Especially if this is your first time driving a car with a manual transmission, start slowly and
methodically. Put your seat belt on once you sit down. While learning, it can be useful to roll down
the windows.This layout is the same for both lefthand drive and righthand drive vehicles. When one
or both are spinning, the clutch allows you to switch gears without grinding the teeth of each
separate gear. Ibrahim Onerli Driving Instructor Ibrahim Onerli is the Partner and Manager of
Revolution Driving School, a New York Citybased driving school with a mission to make the world a
better place by teaching safe driving. Ibrahim trains and manages a team of over 8 driving
instructors and specializes in defensive driving and stick shift driving. This would also be a good
time to take note of how the travel of the clutch pedal differs from that of the brake and gas.With
practice, you’ll get used to using both feet in concert. This is the middle position that feels free when
moved from side to side.If you’re on level ground, you should remain stationary; you’ll start rolling if
you’re on a hill.You may want to practice shifting through the various gears with the engine
switched off and the clutch engaged. Continue until you hear the engine speed begin to drop, then
push it back in.http://www.stromzeleny.cz/crear-manuales-online.xml
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Repeat this several times until you can instantly recognize the sound.In order to get moving, lift your
left foot up from the clutch pedal until the RPMs drop slightly. At the same instant, apply light
pressure to the accelerator with your right foot. Balance the light downward pressure on the
accelerator with slowly releasing pressure on the clutch pedal.At this point the car will start to
move. It is best to have the engine rev just enough to prevent stalling as the clutch pedal is let up.
This process may be a little difficult at first because you are new to the extra pedal in a manual car.
If you release the clutch too quickly the engine will stall. If the engine sounds like it is going to stall,
hold the clutch where it is or push down a bit further. If you do stall, depress the clutch fully, apply
the handbrake, put the car in neutral, switch the engine off and restart the car as normal.This is
called riding the clutch and should be avoided. When your RPM reaches about 2500 to 3000 while
the car is in motion, it is time to shift to the next gear — for example, second gear if you are
currently in first. The actual RPMs at which shifting is required will vary by the car you are driving,
however.Shifting gears in motion is the same as shifting into first from a stationary position. It’s all
about listening, looking, and feeling for the engine’s cues and getting the upanddown timing of your
feet on the pedals correct.Resting your foot on the clutch pedal is a bad habit, as it applies pressure
to the clutch mechanism — and the increased pressure will cause the clutch to wear out
prematurely. If you are going too slow for the current gear you’re in, your car will shudder as if it’s
about to stall.To come to a stop in a fully controlled manner, shift down gradually until you reach
first gear. When it’s time to come to a complete stop, move your right foot from the accelerator to
the brake pedal and press down as much as is
required.http://www.sacca.com.br/imagens/creamware-pulsar-manual.xml
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Press the clutch pedal fully down and move the gearstick into neutral to prevent stalling the car.This
should only be done when you need to stop quickly, though, as it puts you in less control of the
vehicle. While you can legally practice alone on any public road with a valid driver’s license, you will
pick up the nuances of driving a manual car faster if you have an experienced driver accompanying
you. Start off in a flat, isolated area like a large and empty car park, then move on to quiet suburban
streets.When you’re new to driving a manual, plan routes that avoid traffic lights at the top of steep
hills.You can use the parking brake to limit backward drifting if necessary, but always remember to
disengage it as you start moving forward. Unlike automatics, manual transmission cars don’t have a
“park” gear. But, simply putting the car in neutral opens the possibility of your car rolling freely,
especially if parked on an incline or decline.If facing downhill, do the same but shift into reverse.
This will prevent the wheels from rolling in the direction of the slope. However, it is possible on most
manual transmissions to shift into first or possibly second when the car is moving backwards at a
slow speed, but it is not recommended as this can cause excessive wear on the clutch. Before using
the reverse gear, make sure you know about this locking mechanism and how to disengage it before
selecting reverse. The first gear is really only made for starting to get moving or for driving very
slow.Shift gears, then slowly release the clutch and press the accelerator at the same time.The
clutch is meant to disengage your current gear so that you can move to the next gear.You may not
notice you have moved through neutral after doing it many times, but every time you are changing
gears, neutral is an inevitable pass.Then proceed as usual to move forward. Try starting it without
pressing the clutch, and if it doesnt start, then press it.

A manual transmission requires clutch input from the driver, and the driver must change the gears
themselves.Pause at the friction point the part where the engine starts to move the car and continue
slowly pulling the clutch out. That way you can keep your eyes on the road and focus on what is
ahead of you. Initially, you feel inclined to look at the gearstick, but you will need to resist the
temptations. You will feel the car moving a bit, then let down the handbrake and the car will move
freely. The last thing you want is to back into something or someone when you think youve shifted
into first gear. Moisture will freeze and the handbrake might not disengage. A car with an automatic
gearbox is usually a better choice for the urban driver, but every driver has their own personal
preference. Others prefer automatics for their simplicity; as many motorists say all they have to do is
concentrate on their road positioning, and that their knees dont get sore waiting in traffic. It results
in premature wear, loss of power and lowers fuel economy. Your foot should only be on the clutch
pedal and FULLY depressed when you wish to change gears or if you need to quickly remove power
from the drive wheels ie when in a skid on slippery surfaces such as gravel, ice, etc.. The clutch
pedal should only be gradually released when starting out from a stop. Shift into 1st gear to be ready
to start from a stop on an incline, as described in the steps above. Depress the accelerator first then
slowly release the clutch to biting point. The car will move without you aiming for perfect clutch
position. Add more gas when going uphill. A manual transmission requires more experience than an
automatic. Over rev the engine, and severe damage to the engine may result. Shifting into reverse
while the car is in motion will damage most manual gearboxes. You can roll back and hit the person
or object behind you if you are not holding in the brake and the clutch.
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This can help to avoid overheating and damage to the starter and discharging the battery
completely. Amid the current public health and economic crises, when the world is shifting
dramatically and we are all learning and adapting to changes in daily life, people need wikiHow
more than ever. Your support helps wikiHow to create more indepth illustrated articles and videos
and to share our trusted brand of instructional content with millions of people all over the world.
Please consider making a contribution to wikiHow today. Ibrahim Onerli is the Partner and Manager
of Revolution Driving School, a New York Citybased driving school with a mission to make the world
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a better place by teaching safe driving. Ibrahim trains and manages a team of over 8 driving
instructors and specializes in defensive driving and stick shift driving. This article has been viewed
6,027,143 times.Then, turn the car on and take your foot off the clutch pedal. When youre ready to
start driving, press the clutch down and move the gearstick into first gear. Finally, slowly lift your
foot off the clutch while pressing down on the accelerator with your other foot. Dont worry if you
stall out a few times. If you do, just let go of the clutch, apply the handbrake, and start over. If you
want to learn more about when to shift into higher gears, keep reading! After reading that tutorial, I
now have an idea about driving.But after reading this article, I am able to change from 1st to 2nd
and from 2nd to 1st.At least I have the basics.Thanks so much for the article.By continuing to use
our site, you agree to our cookie policy. Please help us continue to provide you with our trusted
howto guides and videos for free by whitelisting wikiHow on your ad blocker. If you really can’t
stand to see another ad again, then please consider supporting our work with a contribution to
wikiHow. When the transmission is in neutral the selector will move sidetoside. Know that the
selector rests between the middle gears.

Isolate the clutch. In other words, use just the clutch to get the vehicle going. Push the clutch back
in when you see the tachometer dip and feel the feel want to move forward. Of course, Im sitting in
the car in a parking lot. But, it can be one of the most satisfying skills to learn, especially if youre
wanting to get into more advanced driving techniques like tracking your vehicle, road racing and
whatnot. Before reading the tutorial, I HIGHLY recommend you watch the video. As it will reinforce
the elements provided in this tutorial and will further assist you in perfecting your newly obtained
manual transmission skills. Without further blabbering, lets get into this tutorial. Add Tip Ask
Question Comment Download Step 1 Ensure Youre in Neutral. Place your car into the neutral gear
by moving the gear selector into the center of the shift boot. In order to verify that your car in truly
in neutral, wiggle the stickshifter around and see if it moves freely. If it doesnt move very freely,
ensure that the gear selector is truly in the middle or not. Verifying that it is, we can move onto our
next step. Add Tip Ask Question Comment Download Step 2 Place Your Foot Onto the Clutch Pedal
Now that our vehicle is in its neutral gear, we may move onto our next step of starting the manual
transmission for use. In order to start a manual transmission vehicle, your left foot must press the
clutch pedal fully to the cars floor. This is a safety feature thats in most modern day vehicles to
ensure less accidents. That being said, depress the clutch pedal fully and move onto the next step.
Add Tip Ask Question Comment Download Step 3 Safety Check Verifying that the car is in neutral by
moving the gear selector to the middle of the stickshift boot, wiggling the gear selector back and
fourth and checking to see if the stickshifter moves freely and also verifying that the clutch pedal is
pressed all the way to the floor, we may continue to our next step.

Add Tip Ask Question Comment Download Step 4 Seek Out the Ignition In order to start the vehicle,
you must locate the ignition. Theyre most commonly located right next to the steering column.
Certain vehicles have pushtostart features, so be aware to check your owners manual if youre not
sure where your vehicles ignition is located. Add Tip Ask Question Comment Download Step 5 Turn
the Ignition Halfway In order to start the vehicle, you must turn the ignition to the halfway position
to allow all the vehicles sensors to take their readings. Add Tip Ask Question Comment Download
Step 6 Turn the Vehicle On With your foot on the clutch pedal fully, your gear selector in the neutral
position, you may turn the vehicles engine over and start the vehicle up. Please check your owners
manual whether or not the vehicle youre driving has an electronic handbrake or not, as these
vehicles will not appear to have a handbrake. Driving with the handbrake engaged is not only
dangerous, due to the heat it produces, but it is also very bad for your vehicle. When disengaging
the handbrake, ensure that you are on a level surface. Add Tip Ask Question Comment Download
Step 8 Prepare Yourself for Rolling Forwards. Now that weve got the vehicle started, were going to
move onto the next steps in driving a manual. At this point in time, it would be a good idea to take a



deep breath, count to ten and relax your muscles. As we will begin to attempt our first feats at
driving a manual transmission. It would be a good idea to put your seat belt on if you havent already
and adjust your seat to the most comfortable position possible. Add Tip Ask Question Comment
Download Step 9 Place Foot Onto Clutch Fully In order to begin the process of moving forwards, we
must depress the clutch fully. As this will be the tool we will be using in order to move the manual
transmission vehicles forwards. Add Tip Ask Question Comment Download Step 10 Move Gear
Selector Into Its First Gear.

While the clutch is fully depressed, move the gear selector into its first gear. In order to do so, refer
to the stick shift pattern located at the top end of the shifter itself. If you cannot find a shift pattern
on your stickshift vehicle, that is okay. As the first gear in most vehicles is located to the top left
portion of your gear selector. That being said, you may move your gear selector light and then
upwards. Keep in mind, certain vehicles could make this process a little tricky. This in itself is all
about trial and error. Add Tip Ask Question Comment Download Step 11 Begin Moving Forwards.
With the clutch fully depressed and the gear selector moved into its first gear, you may begin the
process of moving forwards. In order to begin moving in your manual transmission vehicle, you must
slowly lift the foot that is resting on the clutch pedal. The slower that you remove your foot from the
pedal, the lesser the chance you will stall and higher the chance you will begin moving forwards.
Keep in mind, it is completely normal to stall your first 50100 times attempting to drive manual. Do
not be afraid to stall out the motor or slam on the brakes at any time, as most modern day vehicles
were designed for beginners in mind dropping the clutch and stalling out will NOT damage your
vehicle. Add Tip Ask Question Comment Download Step 12 Give Yourself a Pat on the Back. Learning
to drive manual can be a very complicated process.Dont get discouraged, as many drivers who had
learned how to drive a manual had not done so successfully their first to round. Stay persistent and
youll be rewarded with the skills of a dying art driving a manual. I truly hope youve found this
tutorial enlightening and helpful. Add Tip Ask Question Comment Download Share it with us! I Made
It! Recommendations How to Make Handscrew Clamps However, some corrections for you. To check
if the car is in neutral you do not wiggle it back and fourth, you wiggle it side to side.

To begin moving forward you have to rev the engine. Hold the RPM steady at some point for my car
around 2000 RPM but that will depend heavily on the power of the motor and then start releasing
the clutch. In the beginning use a higher RPM, and slowly relase the clutch halfway until you are
moving. This will reduce the chance of stalling. Once you are comfortable with the RPM and the feel
of the clutch lower the RPM, start relasing faster. Good luck. That helped developed the touch with
their left foot. Once they mastered this, the rest was a breeze for them. 0 PansyB1 BrentB10
Another, may be, that, large pickup trucks arent either. Both of whom, are big sellers here.. 0
DSBenny. PansyB1 I think alot of them have either automatic or tiptronic transmission. Most middle
class and lower end cars have manual. I dont think it will die out soon as most people have never
driven an automatic in their live. But then again, standing still most of the time in traffic might be a
good reason for everybody to switch to automatic. I prefer automatic for that reason, but I also love
the occasional red zone and quick shifting 0 tomatoskins My first car was a manual 69 VW Bug. The
transmission was so wore out that if you didnt apply the right pressure when changing from first to
second, it would grind the gears. So many great memories! Those cars can definitely be hard to
shift, due to their outdated transmission design. However, that only adds to the experience. 0
PansyB1 JohnH641 It has syncros. 0 The Arbiter LOL 0 cidou10 I really hope that anyone who wants
to learn how to drive a stick shift will ask a real person to show them and hopefully take a course.
But thanks for your attempt 1 Rael70 But I understand the problem, Ive got two cars, one with
automatic transmission and one with manual transmission. Thats because many cars do not have a
synchronizer on the reverse gear, for safety reason.

Now its safe to insert the reverse gear without noises; Post Comment Categories Circuits. The



easiest way to drive a manual, or stick shift, car, from starting the engine to shifting gears without
stalling. After studying this detailed guide, you will be able to start the car, get it moving, and then
upshift into higher gears with ease. Dont be disappointed if you dont get it at first. It took me a while
to get used to a stick shift, but it was well worth it. Keep practicing and practicing and you will get
it. Have fun! At the end, I have included some common questions about driving a stick shift and
some basic tips on how to drive an automatic transmission car as well. How to Drive a Manual or
Stick Shift Car for Beginners Find a flat, paved place with no one around where you can practice.
With just the right amount of gas, your car will begin to move forward. When I got my 2012 Mustang
GT with a manual transmission, I was so excited about driving it. I looked up some guides on how to
drive a manual car and didnt think it was going to be difficult to learn. How wrong I was. My
412horsepower and 390torque Coyote engine was a difficult car to drive. I stalled it left and right.
Eventually I learned that you dont need to step on the gas to get the car moving. Depending on the
speed at which the engine idles—that is, the speed it runs at when youre not pushing on the gas
pedal—just releasing the clutch some will move the car to an extent. I played with the clutch and got
a feel for the friction point or biting point; that is, the point where the car is rolling, but the clutch is
asking you to add more gas. At this point, you feel a little resistance, a little vibration from the clutch
pedal; the car is asking for enough gas so that it can run when the clutch is fully out. After
incorporating what I had learned with this newfound technique, my first start was the smoothest one
yet.

Make sure you are in a secluded area and that you have enough space in front of you so you can
move at different speeds without running into something. Get to Know Where the Gears Are With
the engine off, move the stick around. On this stick, reverse is to the right and down. On other stick
shifts reverse is to the left and up. Bill Selak via Flickr CC BYND 2.0 Know the Pedals The far left is
not a pedal, its a resting place for your foot while driving. The clutch pedal is second from the left.
The brake is next and the gas is on the far right. To be sure you are in neutral, wiggle the stick back
and forth. Start the Car in Neutral To start the car, push the clutch in all the way in, hold it down,
and turn the key. Make sure the car is in neutral before releasing the clutch. If you can, you are in
neutral. Now you are just sitting there with the engine running, doing nothing and going nowhere,
which is just fine for this first step. Press the clutch in all the way and move the gear shift into first
gear. Usually this is to the left and up away from you. Shift Into First Gear Now push the clutch in all
the way, and put the car into first gear using the gear stick. Youll usually find first gear by pushing
the stick left and then away from you. Keep the clutch in or you will stall the car. But dont worry You
will stall trying to shift into gear, but with time you will get it. Some cars have a pushbutton
emergency, or parking, brake control as above. Many others have a lever with release button at the
end. Release the Emergency Brake Now that the car is running, make sure your emergency brake
handbrake is off. Since you are on flat ground, the car wont roll anywhere while you are figuring out
what to do. Press down on the gas until the needle on your tachometer is between 1000 and 2000
rpm. Release the Clutch and Give the Engine Some Gas Once you are in first gear, slowly release the
clutch until you feel the car just start moving. This is the tricky part.

Get a feel for this biting point when the car starts to shudder a bit because it will make learning to
drive manual a lot easier. Practice until you can get to the point quickly. Begin to slowly add some
gas by pushing down the gas pedal a little bit. If you give too little gas, the car will stall. If you give
too much, you begin to burn the clutch, which is no big deal for a beginner, but over time can wear
out the clutch. Release the Clutch After Gears Engage Now that you are giving the car a little bit of
gas, dont release the clutch fully just yet. Release it when you can feel the gears engage. This will
feel like a vibration you can sense through the sole of your foot. Once you get to that point, you can
release the clutch, and drive around without using the clutch, just as you would in an automatic
transmission car. Congratulations! You have started a manual car. I found this technique of looking
for the biting point made it easier for me to learn manual. Once I came across this method, I learned



how to drive very quickly. I believe this is truly the easiest way to drive a manual car. Just push the
clutch back in and turn the key, and that will start the car back up. Make sure the car is in neutral,
and go through the steps again. Whenever you feel like the car is going to stall, you can just push
the clutch back in. To shift from first to second, press in on the clutch and pull the gear shift down
towards you. To shift up to third gear, press in on the clutch and move the gear shift up and to the
right. Shifting Into Higher Gears Shifting, in my opinion, is a lot easier than starting to move the car.
You shift from 1, to 2, to 3, to 4, to 5, and then to 6, if you have a sixth gear. How do you shift into
the higher gears. It is pretty much the same procedure as starting the car up, except much easier.
Lets say you are in first gear going into second. Follow these procedures. Put the clutch in, and then
move the stick to second.

In order to make a totally smooth shift, you have to balance the gas and the clutch very well. Dont
worry, this comes with practice. To shift from first to second and then into higher gears, watch your
tachometer. When the neele reads 2500 or 3000 rpms, your engine is ready for you to shift into
higher gear. Shift Up When the Engine Reaches 2500 RPM How do you know when to shift. You can
either look at the rpms or the speed you are going. You should usually shift at 2500 to 3000 rpms.
The speed to shift gears varies with the car you are driving, so look at the instruction manual to
determine the speeds. The speed for each gear isnt as important for upshifting as it is for
downshifting. Eventually you will be able to tell when to shift by the way the engine sounds and
feels. To start the engine, you must be in neutral gear. Wiggle the gear shift back and forth to be
sure you are in neutral. After starting the engine, keep the clutch pressed in all the way. Watch the
needle on your tachometer. You can completely release the clutch when the needle is between 1,000
and 2,000 rpm. Just push the clutch back in and turn the key, and that will start the car back up. So
why did you stall. You put the car into first gear, but you didnt give the car enough gas to move. It
wanted to move, but there wasnt enough gas, so it stalled. Whenever you feel like the car is going to
stall, you can just push the clutch back in. How Do I Stop a Manual Car. You dont need to press in
the clutch every time you press the brake to slow down. But when coming to a full stop at a stop sign
or traffic signal, press in on the clutch when you are almost to a full stop and shift into neutral, or
you will stall the car. From a full stop, press the clutch in all the way and move the gear shift into
reverse just as you would when shifting into any other gear. Because you control the gear changes
yourself, the car can run more economically and efficiently in manual than in automatic.

The brake is in the middle and the accelerator or gas pedal is on the far right. Basic Steps to Driving
an Automatic Transmission Car Eight Steps to Get You Moving 1. Find a flat, paved place with no
one around so you can practice. 2. Adjust your mirrors so you can see behind and to the side of your
car. 3. Familiarize yourself with the pedals brake on the left, gas on the right. 4. With the car in park
and the emergency brake on, turn the key to start the engine. 5. With your foot on the brake, release
the emergency brake. 6. With your foot still on the brake, put the car in drive. 7. Lift your foot off the
brake and slowly press down on the gas pedal. 8. Practice gently pressing the brake. At first you will
press too hard and the car will jerk to a stop. With practice, stopping and starting will be smoother.
Let Me Know How it Goes. These are my techniques for learning how to drive a manual and much
easier but less fun an automatic transmission car. Leave a comment below with a question or
comment. This article is accurate and true to the best of the author’s knowledge. Content is for
informational or entertainment purposes only and does not substitute for personal counsel or
professional advice in business, financial, legal, or technical matters. Comments Rogers mukisa on
August 31, 2020 Very easy to understand I now drive my car Thanks Yvie on August 25, 2020 Dude.
Yesh. Danke. Mamie Honorine on August 17, 2020 Thanks a lot its so helpful, Im a learner
driving,you really help Oluwagbemi A.A on August 17, 2020 thank you so much for the teaching. I
salute you and we need honest people like you.so now am very confident to start.Im more at ease
with your help and hope my instructor would minimise his screaming for my next class emmanuel on
January 15, 2020 Thanks am so grateful Oliver on December 15, 2019 Look man, I cant wait to thank



you a lot. Right now I am sitting in my dads car ready to move it without his concern. Lol. It is fun
knowing this from you.

Thanks a lot Rose king on November 28, 2019 Well as a 14 year old its way easyer than I thought
victor on November 28, 2019 thank you, very helpful Saba Kanwal on November 18, 2019 Very
helpful Charlyne.Talvat on October 31, 2019 Simple instruction and understandable. Thanks Man
beth on October 27, 2019 thank you. Cheryl kirkpatrick on July 14, 2019 I screen shot all the steps
and am already understanding it.thank you for your time.appreciated. ikechukwu emmanuel on July
04, 2019 this is very nice LASTON MBALE on July 03, 2019 These are the people we need who are
not just depleting Oxygen but appreciate nature by return the purpose of there existence. To those
who are behind them Above all this peace of teaching has been a delicious meal to my hungry soul
Good luck. Derrick Mutuma on April 26, 2019 I recommend as it is a nice teaching as even for the
beginners it is a nice process and easy procedure to follow. Congrats. Noe Munoz on March 31, 2019
You explain this the way my dad taught me. And after I learned I realized that is the hardest way to
learn. Perhaps on your car is works because all cars are different but I wouldnt recommend it for a
low torque engine. In my cars as long as your at 2k before taking off the clutch the car wont stall. I
even tried to stall on purpose and had a very hard time stalling. Again, not saying your way of
teaching is bad. Just that it is specific for certain types of cars. Moses on March 06, 2019 wow,this is
good well explained.am sure i will learn soon.thanks Alain bangila on February 24, 2019 Add Your
Comment.thank you so much Tash on February 08, 2019 Thank you so much, my driving instructor
didnt explain even half of any of this and continued to get frustrated when I still, somehow,
surprisingly, didnt get it, thank you thank you thank you Akpan on February 07, 2019 Thanks for this
detailed instruction on how to drive a manual car. I find it very useful. God bless you.
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