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It may not display this or other websites correctly. You should upgrade or use an alternative
browser. Whe are a small pvc card shop. Whe bought a KM C3070 to print in house and have more
control on rush job. In the best world i would only do this on the machine and keep it simple but my
boss want to offer business card flyers and menu to our customers. Since i will do it all and wanted
something simple to use with my lack of experience i think the Duplo machine is a perfect to begin
with. The KM come with ic314 running Creo color server. I the finisfini setting i can select the dc645
and it will add bar code and registration mark. What i dont know is how this new template that is
best fit or manual imposition is transferred to the dc645 Or is it possible to import all the imposition
template from the dc645 job creation software to the creo. Is there any software with the dc645 to
do imposition and export to pdf. Also whe buy a dc645 yo begin because of price and need. Thank
you for your help.I think what i need is a good imposition software. As for the machine i found a
good deal in canada but its used and have no warranty i must find if i can get a service contract for
it.I think what you getting as far as Duplo software is somewhat imposition software that you create
the template in, use it to drop in your images and print out of it. If you dont need to change jobs too
often, you can program and save number of jobs in to machine, then generic imposition software will
do but youd need to adjust with the machine VIA trial and error.I can make template in the duplo
software and then make imposition yo match it. By they i gogot a brand new dc616 pro it will do for
us and got a good price at the Graphic canada show.I would make my imposition in Impose, then
create the template in the Duplo software. I also suggest not using the barcode reader. It slows it
down significantly because it reads each sheet.http://ruxthai.com/userfiles/dcr-sr57e-manual.xml

duplo 645 service manual, duplo dc 645 service manual, duplo 645 service manual,
duplo 645 service manual pdf, duplo 645 service manual download, duplo 645 service
manual free, duplo 645 service manual instructions.

Just save your impose templates with the same number as on the Duplo and it will be easy to match
up and load the job profile each time.And we would like to thank experienced pressmen for sharing
your knowledge with the Color Printing Forum community. This page requires Javascript. Modify
your browsers settings to allow Javascript to execute. See your browsers documentation for specific
instructions. Some of the functions of this website will not work without JavaScript. Click here for
instructions on enabling JavaScript in your browser. Please check your Duplo Machine parts list or
operations manual for the correct part number for your machine. Discover everything Scribd has to
offer, including books and audiobooks from major publishers. Start Free Trial Cancel anytime.
Report this Document Download Now Save Save Duplo List For Later 0 ratings 0% found this
document useful 0 votes 327 views 10 pages Duplo List Uploaded by Reparacion Copiadoras
Impresoras Description Duplo imaging service manuals list Full description Save Save Duplo List For
Later 0% 0% found this document useful, Mark this document as useful 0% 0% found this document
not useful, Mark this document as not useful Embed Share Print Download Now Jump to Page You
are on page 1 of 10 Search inside document Browse Books Site Directory Site Language English
Change Language English Change Language. These incredible machines are from top quality
manufactures such as Duplo and Cyklos, which is why we are sure you will love them. All our card
creasing machines come with free installation and operations training as well as free delivery within
mainland UK. We are dedicated to helping you and we know our great creasers can help you and
your print finishing process which is why are determined to help you find the perfect match for your
needs. Creasing And Perforating Machine. In DF505N, paper is singlefolded by folding plate 1.
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Duplo DF505N Pdf User Manuals.http://gshosnab.ru/userfiles/dcr-sr80-manual.xml

View online or download Duplo DF505N Instruction Manual. View and Download Duplo DF505N
instruction manual online. DF505N Folding Machines pdf manual download. Manual Setting Folder.
Affordable Folding At Your Fingertips. The DF505N is convenient, easy to use, and designed with
the budget conscious in mind. Featuring the same performance and reliability of Duplos automatic
models, the DF505N is compactly framed at an affordable price. The DF505N is easy to use, and.
DF505N Manual setting folder. The DF505N provides the most folding versatility with all its
features, performance, and reliable compact frame. Sections found in the maintenance manual of the
DF520N have been omitted. Refer to the maintenance manual for DF520N for. This affordable folder
offers popular folding applications that help firsttime users become experienced users within
minutes. Whether your folding application is a letter, flier, brochure, or billing statement, the setup
is simple. This Duplo paper folder will fold up to 120 sheets per minute. It has a 4digit LCD digital
counter and two knobs for making finetune adjustments to fold setu. Thank you for purchasing this
Duplo equipment. To ensure correct usage, please read this instruction manual thoroughly,
especially the section. Safety Precautions. The aim of this instruction manual is safe and proper use.
For this reason, users of this equipment for purposes or by methods other than those described in
this. The userfriendly DF755 Manual Folder quickly folds a variety of paper sizes and stocks up to
120 sheets per minute. Whether the application is a letter, flyer, brochure, or billing statement, the
setup is simple. Two easytofollow charts indicate where to position each fold stopper for six popular
folds. For nonstandard paper. Duplo DF505N folder This folder has been tested and runs perfectly.
Instructions duplo folder df Read more about paper, folding, fold, button, when and press.

We are a factory authorized dealer for Baum, Duplo, MBM, and Martin Yale. We have. Duplo part
manual pdfs for the DF520, DF915, and DF920 paper folders are listed below so click on the links to
find other parts you may need and call us at. DF505N Folding Machines pdf manual downloa. DC10
Mini Collator DC10NP Collator DC24ST Collator System DC535 Cutter DC545 DocuCutter.
DC545HC DocuCutter. DCMicro8 Friction Feed Collator DCS4 Stapler DF505 Duplo Folder DF505N
Duplo Folder DF510 Duplo Folder DF520 Duplo Folder DF520N Duplo Folder DFC10 Collator
DFC10B Collator Phase 1 case 580k shop service repair manual 580 k loa. Duplo df 915 paper
folding machine click to see video!. Duplo support, manuals customer service. Image is loading
duplo df 505 folder. Duplo df980 a3 automatic friction fed folder machine. Parts and accessories for
baum, duplo, mbm, and martin yale paper folders. Nov. 15, 2010 PRLog The DF505N provides the
most folding versatility with all its features, performance, and reliable compact frame.Duplo
DC24ST, SM, PC, ENG. Duplo DC445, SM, PC, ENG. Duplo DC535, SM, PC, ENG. Duplo DC545, SM,
PC, ENG. Duplo DC615, SM, PC, ENG. Duplo DC645, SM, PC, ENG. Duplo DCMicro8, SM, PC, ENG.
Duplo DCS4, SM, PC, ENG. Duplo DF1000, SM, PC, ENG. Duplo DF505, SM, PC, ENG. Duplo
DF510. DUPLO DF505N Manual Setting Tabletop Folder. Features Quickly folds a variety of paper
sizes and types up to 140 sheets per minute. When powering back on, the fast setup mode allows the
DF915 to automatically recall the last job. Simply load the feed tray with up to 500 sheets, select the
fold type, and hit start. The Duplo DF915 is the fastest, most easy to use tabletop folder for all
applications demanding speed and precision folding. DF505N Manual. Encontre Dobradeira Duplo
Df505 no Mercado Livre Brasil. Descubra a melhor forma de comprar online.

DCMicro8 Friction Feed Collator DCS4 Stapler DF505 Duplo Folder DF505N Duplo Folder DF510
Duplo Folder DF520 Duplo Folder DF520N Duplo Folder DFC10 Collator DFC10B Collator.
DOBLADORA DUPLO DF 505N Equipo en perfecto estado lista para trabajar mantenimiento al dia
adjunto link manual para que puedan apreciar todo lo que hace.Duplo DF 505N Folder Description
Manual Setting Tabletop AMERICA North USACanadaMexico Maintenance Manual describes basic
functions, theory of electrical and mechanical operations, maintenance and repair procedures and
all the necessary information to service. This Maintenance manual has been prepared for DF505,
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providing basic information used for servicing the machines in the field so as to ensure. Your model
may return multiple results, some of which may contain only the parts list. With this in mind, please
make your selection carefully before purchase. If we have the parts list. Duplo DC445, SM, PC, pdf,
English. Duplo DC535, SM, PC, pdf, English. Duplo DC545, SM, PC, pdf, English. Duplo DC615, SM,
PC, pdf, English. Duplo DC645, SM, PC, pdf, English. Duplo DCMicro8, SM, PC, pdf, English. Duplo
DCS4, SM, PC, pdf, English. Duplo DF1000, SM, PC, pdf, English. Capacity, 24x48 Table, Maximum
Lift 45. Duplo, Call for pricing, Details. Full Automatic Table Top Paper Folder DF920. High Volume
Automatic Paper Folder DF505N Duplo, Call for pricing, Details. Manual Adjustment Paper Folder
FD340. Formax, Call for pricing, Details. This affordable folder offers popular folding applications
that can be set up using two easytofollow charts. Even more comforting is that firsttime users
become experienced within minutes. Whether your folding application is a letter, flier, brochure, or
billing statement, the set up is simple. The DF505N also features a tray. DF505 Duplo Folder
DF505N Duplo Folder DF510 Duplo Folder DF520 Duplo Folder DF520N Duplo Folder DFC10
Collator DFC10B Collator DFC12 Collator Duplo product line.

Duplo Service Manuals Complete ServiceRepairManual, and its in PDF format. It contains circuit
diagrams schemas etc. We have proficiency in offering quality services in order to provide our
customers most satisfactory and valueadded services help them to meet their requirements. It also
usually contains parts. Duplo Products Service Technical Manuals Manual on a CD. Duplo
schematics and repair instructions.Manual Setting Folder. Affordable Folding at Your Fingertips.
The DF755 Folder is convenient, easy to use, and designed with the budget conscious in mind.
Featuring the same performance and reliability of Duplos automatic models, the. DF755 is compact
and affordable in price. Userfriendly, the DF755 quickly. Paper Folding Machines Support. Duplo ha
tenido mucho exito con sus plegadoras con sistema de alimentacion tanto de friccion como de
succion. La nueva DF755 sustituye a la DF505N con todas sus especificaciones. Manual de Servico
Duplo DF505 Outro em formato PDF vai ajudalo a encontrar as falhas, reparar e restaurar o
funcionamento do dispositivo Duplo DF505. These are Duplo Factory Repair Service Technical
Manuals, Maintenance Guides, User Guides, Parts Catalogs, Installation Guides and More. DF505
Duplo Folder DF505N Duplo Folder DF510 Duplo Folder DF520 Duplo Folder DF520N Duplo Folder
DFC10 Collator DFC10B Collator DFC12 Collator Duplo folders are designed to quickly and
accurately fold finished sheets. Designed for applications from the professional ondemand printing
environment to busy offices, Duplo folders offer a wide range of folding options.Duplo DF505N
Folding Machine. Stack Capacity 500 sheets. Speed Up to 120 sheets per minute.DCS4 Stapler
DF505 Duplo Folder DF505N Duplo Folder. Find operators manuals for your Lincoln Electric
welders, wirefeeders, Parts page listings can be found at Service Navigator. Duplo DC8 Service
manual.

The Duplo DF505N provides the most folding versatility with all its features, performance, and
reliable compact frame. It is easy to use with its full color LCD touch screen which has graphical
instructions to help guide you to quickly and simply operate the machine.DP440 SERIEShelp,
DCS4sm,pc,um, V170pc. DP440pc,sm, DF505sm,pc,um, V310pc,um. DP460pc,sm, DF505Npc,um,
V350pc,um. DP63Psm,um, DF510pc,sm, V415sm,pc,um. DP63Ssm,um, DF520sm,pc,um,
V570sm,pc,um. Keyword Suggestions. Images for Duplo Df 505n Folder Manual. Duplo Folder
Instruction Manual GBC www.yumpu.com. 1 Duplo DF 505N, Folder Printing and Graphic
Equipment. www.wotol.com. DF505N. Duplo DF505 Service Manual, Parts Catalog Plus huge bonus
gifts if you buy DOWNLOAD. For a better experience, please enable JavaScript in your browser
before proceeding. It may not display this or other websites correctly. You should upgrade or use an
alternative browser. Any help would be appreciated. Duplo tech for a dealer in Iowa. Windows or
Mac Also what folding option Follow the link. The advantages can put money on your bottom line. So
what’s your next step For the best experience on our site, be sure to turn on Javascript in your



browser. Unlike any in the industry, the DC646 slits, cuts, creases and perforates documents in a
single pass up to 30 sheets per minute while your operators are busy working with other equipment.
The scanner also reads registration marks, correcting the sheetbysheet image shift and delivering
accurately finished pieces every time. Barcodes and registration marks can be easily applied with
the EFI Fiery Command Workstation impose tool Fiery System 10 or newer. It can take a full
650x370mm sheet up to 350gsm and deliver a wide array of completed products. Furthermore
automated set up, bar code reader and CCD camera to ensure accurate register mean that less
experienced operators can deliver high quality finished products.

The optional business card module makes light work of a highly popular product type. A 100mm
input tray means that the unit can run unattended. Trim removal to a waste bin keeps the
environment clean. CCD camera ensures that creases and trims are placed in precisely the right
place, keeping any waste to an absolute minimum. More Information More Information Electrical
115v 60hz Custom Stock Status Ships 710 days Type Wireo Sheet Capacity 5 sheets Manufacturer
Duplo Reviews Write Your Own Review Youre reviewing Duplo DC 646 Slitter, Cutter, Creaser
Nickname Summary Review Submit Review Product Questions 1 Customer Questions Duplo DC616
vs Duplo DC618 vs Duplo DC646 The specification differences between the Duplo DC 616, Duplo DC
618 and Duplo DC 646 are outlined here.Min 8.26 x 8.26” 210 x 210mm Max 12.58 x 18.11” 320 x
460mm. Min 8. Read More Did you find what you were looking for. Ask a Question Your question
Your name get notification on email when the answer is ready Your email Please Fill Recaptcha To
Continue Send the Question Get a Quote for Customer Name Customer Email Phone Number
Comment Submit We found other products you might like.Sign up for newsletter today. Offering
greater speed, productivity and versatility, the Duplo DC745 not only processes jobs faster, it also
finishes a wider range of digitallyprinted applications in a single pass. Performing up to 10 slits, 25
cuts and 20 creases in a single pass, this digital color finisher eliminates white borders and toner
cracking on fold lines, producing professionally finished, fullbleed documents in a matter of minutes.

Key Challenges Multiple finishing devices are required to provide for a fullbleed, finished document
Paper guillotine cutters require skilled operators with continuous operator presence Timeconsuming
setups, makereadies, and turnaround times for shortrun jobs High document waste due to too many
finishing processes, lack of equipment automation, and antiquated devices White borders associated
with digital output Toner cracking on fold lines Inability to handle complex applications that have a
variety of finishing requirements Job size changes have to be manually set up each and every time,
even if running the same job the next day Up to 50 sheets per minute means faster turnaround times
High stack capacity for minimal reloading PC Controller for quick and easy operation Barcode
scanner reads barcodes and registration marks for automatic job changeover and image shift
compensation Ability to perform 25 cuts enables it to produce 36up business cards Why Choose
Xerox. Duplo DC745 supports all Xerox cut sheet presses The Duplo DC745 can process 26” length
paper Functionality may vary by product model. Contact your local sales representative for detailed
compatibility information. Call 5018214579 or new email address We’ve been selling and Whether
you need advice on We have the best paper cutters, paper Yes, its that easy. 10% discount on any
Duplo machines purchased during July. Finish collated and Go Green and eliminate costly and
hazardous chemistry! Feeders and Stackers available too. We offer onsite training for the brands we
sell We all have many options when purchasing bindery If there is any issue with any product we
purchase Buds Graphics is Mississippi, Missouri, Oklahoma, Tennessee, and Texas. What ever your
business goal, we are here to. Duplo DC646 Slitter Cutter Creaser Manuals. This comes printed on
paperManuals Service, Parts, Instruction If you do not see your Duplo machine, please ask. Other
Duplo manuals and software are available!

Super high amount of views. 0 sold, 9999 available. More Super high amount of views. 0 sold, 9999
available. You are the light of the world. Erro tente novamente OK Idioma atual LANG BR Portugues



English Vender Lista de itens observados Expandir lista de itens observados Carregando. Ocorreu
um problema. Veja detalhes no carrinho. Esse valor esta sujeito a mudancas ate o momento em que
voce efetuar o pagamento. Para obter mais informacoes, veja os termos e condicoes do Programa de
Entrega Internacional abre em janela ou guia separada Este valor esta sujeito a alteracao ate voce
efetuar o pagamento. Se voce reside em um pais membro da Uniao Europeia que nao seja o Reino
Unido, o imposto sobre a venda nao e recuperavel. Para obter mais informacoes, veja os termos e
condicoes do Programa de Entrega Internacional abre em janela ou guia separada Meter only 8,930.
” The item may be missing original packaging and may have been used for testing or demo purposes.
The item includes accessories found with the original product and may include a warranty. See the
sellers listing for full details and description. Meter only 8,930. ” Todos os direitos reservados.
Contrato do Usuario, Privacidade, Cookies e AdChoice Norton Secured powered by Verisign. There
are several machines available to help with further automating projects for the smallest print shop.
MBM and Duplo both have an automated slitter, cutter and creaser that can automate what would
once be a manual process on three different machines. Of course, from the end user perspective or
to that of the small business owner, these technical details spell the difference between hundreds of
dollars in savings or the potential for long term gains. In the printing business, efficiency and
streamlining issues such as wastage and additional processing input take not only time but also
valuable resources. When taken in the longer run these could account for a significant amount of
money.

This is an essential factor when comparing the MBM Aerocut G2 with the Duplo DC 645. While the
DC 645 could handle 26 sheets per minute and the G2 could handle 20, it would be noteworthy to
highlight that the G2 handles an additional process in that it could also score and perforate aside
from the standard slit, cut and crease that the DC 645 does. The DC 645 uses a belt suction system
while the G2 uses an air suction system. However, the main difference is in the G2 which
incorporates a nifty feature that allows for an automatic reversal and auto refeed system for
correcting errors. This is a crucial point in a creaser that could save any job order a lot of time. The
main advantage of the Aerocut G2 is that it is an all in one solution that is sold as is. The DC 645
sells the machine on a modular basis meaning you have to purchase additional components for
specific requirements. This is a key deciding factor that should not be overlooked. For one, the
additional cost introduces another factor into the equation. For small job orders or for the small
business, this could mean the difference between profitability or loss. Their performances are almost
at par with each other save for a few minor technical differences. Both could be a valuable asset that
could improve your operations through the streamlining of specific finishing functions. How each
would suit your requirements would totally be up to you. Garry is a thought leader in the ever
changing landscape of marketing and printing. Also, get exclusive offers from Lloyds of Indiana.
Emails are serviced by Constant Contact The Print Finish Blog is your place to find out what they
know to help your own business. Come back often to stay up to date. All rights reserved. For more
information click here GST will be added to the buyers premium. See User Agreement This is
because Grays sells a wide range of products in a variety of Conditions on behalf of our Vendors.

Its important that you read the Lot Description for possible additional information on the Condition
of the product including any applicable warranty details. You should take the Condition and the Lot
Description into account when you place your bid as we do not offer refunds if you change your mind
about your purchase. Some individual items may show signs of wear common with used items, and in
some instances, accessories may vary from the standard for example, software or manuals may be
missing or different, no original packaging. OTHER Products are listed as being in Other Condition
when they do not fit into any of the other Conditions listed. This can include items such as
collectable wines, certain works of art and other memorabilia. NEW Products listed as New are
unused and still in their original packaging, complete with manuals and accessories, although they
may not necessarily be the latest model. GraysOnline will provide Safety information relating to the



condition of the item of plant for sale Plant Hazard Reports Clear identification and marking to
identify that the plant item is only suitable for scrap or spare parts Site Access, PPE and Removal of
Plant requirements are listed under the Inspection and Collection Headings. Please note Persons
under the age of 15 years will not be permitted onsite. Tradespeople eg; electricians, plumbers etc
will be required to produce the relevant licence before commencing work on site. Riggers, Forklift
and Crane Drivers etc will be required to produce the relevant license before commencing work on
site. It is a condition of entry to site that all visitors comply with any directions given by Grays NSW
Pty Ltd staff or their representatives. All power tools and equipment used on this site must be tested
tagged safe for use in accordance with AS3760 service testing and inspection of electrical
equipment.

Examples fixedwired electrical equipment, such as air conditioners, stoves, ovens, electric hot water
systems, ceiling fans, light fittings electrical accessories, such as socket outlets, light switches,
electrical cable, wall switches, plugs and cord extension sockets electrical parts, such as electrical
motors, switches, solenoids, elements Electrical Power Tools and Equipment Inc.The electrical
articles have not been tested by a qualified electrical worker and have not been proved to be
electrically safe. General advice on how to use secondhand electrical power tools and equipment
including electrical leads safely. General safe use advice for electrical power tools and equipment
etc.This advice is not intended to replace specific manufacturers information but can be used as a
general guide. This advice does not cater for young children or people who are physically weak. You
are urged to Use the power tool only for its intended purpose. If the power tool is for indoor use
only, do not use outdoors. Do not immerse the power tool in water unless it is designed for this
purpose. Keep hands, fingers, feet, toes and hair away from dangerous moving parts, cutting blades
and the like. Do not use electrical power tools in the rain. Make sure you have dry hands when
operating an electrical power tool. Do not use a damaged power tool. A power tool may not be
intended for use by children or people with an illness or disability without supervision. Young
children should not be allowed to play with the power tool. Some power tools require special
precautions for installation or user maintenance or both. The plug must be removed from the
socketoutlet before any cleaning or maintenance is done. Do not place cord extension sockets or
portable power outlet boards where they may be splashed or where moisture may get in. Ensure
ventilation holes or outlets are not blocked or partially obstructed.

If a fixed power tool does not have a supply cord and plug or other means for disconnection from the
supply, a means for disconnection must be incorporated into the fixed wiring according to the Wiring
Rules. If the supply cord or plug is damaged The manufacturer or its service agent or a similarly
qualified person must replace the cord to prevent an accident. Power tools with specially prepared
cords must be replaced by a special cord or assembly available from the manufacturer or its service
agent. Other power tools that have a supply cord that cannot be replaced, should be scrapped. The
power tool should be maintained in order to ensure a long, useful life and to protect the operator
against electric shock or mechanical mishaps. A safety switch can enhance electrical safety when
using electrical power tools. Please familiarise yourself with these terms prior to bidding on any
items in this auction. Assets included in this sale may be used, therefore inspection is highly
recommended prior to bidding. Photos and descriptions should be used as a guide only.Motor Dealer
Licence 1700072 The terms and conditions of the online auctions may change from time to time.
Please ensure you clearly read the special terms and conditions contained in this page and also in
the bidder’s agreement. Bidders may find when they do perform a PPSR check highly recommended
in many cases the cars do have an encumbrance, which will be lifted as soon as the vehicle is sold at
auction and monies are cleared in our account. GraysOnline staff are onsite for security purpose
only, please make sure you have people to help you load your purchases and provide suitable
transport. Assets included in this sale may be used, therefore inspection is highly recommended
prior to bidding. Some individual items may show signs of excessive wear and in some instances



accessories or inclusions may vary from the standard. Photos, descriptions and conditions reports if
any should be used as a guide only.

Bids on assets in this sale should be made based on your own inspection and assessment of the
goods. GraysOnline do not test auction items. We provide no warranty as to the items working
condition or suitability for its intended purpose. No refunds will be given. If you are unsure, do not
bid. To assist in the processing of payments please have funds available.Please ensure you clearly
read the special terms and conditions contained in this page and also in the users agreement. Buyers
Please Note A Buyers premium as described applies to all lots purchased in this sale and will be
added to the bid price. Collection of assets is the responsibility of the purchaser. GraysOnline staff
are onsite for security purpose only, please make sure you have people to help you load your
purchases and provide suitable transport. Goods not collected within the specified time frame may
be deemed abandoned. Storage and other handling charges may apply.There is no limit to the
number of times an online auction can be extended. This makes GraysOnline work more like a live
auction where the bidding doesnt stop as long as there is still interest in the product, rather than
assigning an arbitrary cutoff time. This means it is a good idea to watch the action as the auction
nears closing time and to check back often It is a condition of entry that all persons conduct
themselves in a manner which does not endanger the health and safety of other persons on site, and
which does not create a risk to health and safety. Personal Protective Equipment PPE All visitors to
the site mut be wearing fully enclosed shoes, preferably safety boots. Do not wear thongs NO
EXCEPTIONS. If you intend to send a third party to collect your goods on your behalf, you need to
send them with a copy of your winners email along with a photocopy of your photo ID and signed
note of authority permitting staff to release your purchases to the third party.


